
Physics Lab Equipment
Bid #07-07  2:00 PM      November 16, 2006
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EPCNT Agreement/Pricing Valid Until Yes 2/28/07 Yes 2/16/07 NO Yes 6/30/07 Yes 3/31/07 Yes 12/31/07 Yes 12/31/07 Yes 3/30/07

Brands

Frey, 
Fourier, 

CPO 
Science Vernier EAI, Vernier

TI-CBL, 
Vernier

Fourier, 
Vernier Vernier D&H

1 Lab Pro Inteface w/Voltage Probe 14 198.00 220.00 275.73 214.90 220.00 204.00 209.00 217.80
2 Motion Detector 22 64.00 75.00 94.00 73.87 75.00 64.00 71.25 74.21
3 Microphone 22 32.00 37.00 46.37 35.97 37.00 30.00 35.15 36.62
4 Light Sensor 30 42.00 49.00 61.41 47.99 49.00 39.00 46.55 48.49
5 (Vernier) Photogate 38 40.00 45.00 56.40 42.97 45.00 37.00 42.75 44.53
6 Pulley Attachments 14 67.00 23.00 28.83 22.47 23.00 25.00 21.85 22.95
7 Picket Fence 44 no bid 5.00 6.27 4.93 5.00 5.00 4.75 4.99
8 Stainless Steel Temp Probe 14 26.00 29.00 36.35 27.99 29.00 24.00 27.55 28.70
9 Magnetic Field Sensor 30 51.00 56.00 70.19 54.95 56.00 47.00 53.20 55.42
10 Differential Voltage Probe 22 32.00 35.00 43.87 34.49 35.00 30.00 33.25 34.63
11 Current Probe 38 34.00 37.00 46.37 36.29 37.00 32.00 35.15 36.61
12 (Vernier) Dynamics System w/Track 15 149.95 249.00 312.08 242.83 249.00 249.00 236.55 246.38
13 (Vernier) Circuit Board 8 94.92 84.00 105.28 82.83 84.00 84.00 79.80 no bid
14 Wireless Dynamics Sensor Sys 8 no bid 249.00 312.08 242.83 249.00 249.00 236.55 246.38
15 Force Plate 10 95.00 199.00 249.41 196.83 199.00 199.00 199.00 196.90
16 Logger Probe 3 (CD only) 1 62.80 159.00 190.80 157.83 10.00 159.00 included 157.34
17 Bluetooth USB Adapter 8 5.00 25.00 31.33 24.99 25.00 23.00 25.00 no bid
18 Dual-Range Force Sensor 22 95.00 109.00 136.61 107.97 109.00 88.00 103.55 107.86
19 Low-G Accelerometer 14 95.00 98.00 123.16 96.95 98.00 88.00 93.10 96.97
20 Optics Expansion Kit 7 no bid 149.00 186.75 146.83 149.00 149.00 141.55 147.60
21 Rotary Motion Sensor 2 156.00 199.00 249.41 195.73 199.00 145.00 199.00 196.90

Grand Total 20,285.41 27,487.00 34,446.51 26,932.99 27,338.00 24,925.00 26,091.00 26,343.18
incomplete incomplete

Extras:
  Site license/data analysis software 3 59.00
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